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INSIDE: Fern talks about the Sisterhood series--and more!

Justice Has A New Outfit

Life isn't fair. Most women know it. But what can you do about it? Plenty. . .if you're part of the Sisterhood.
On the surface, these seven women are as different as can be--but each has had her share of bad luck, from
cheating husbands to sexist colleagues to a legal system that often doesn't do its job. Now, drawn together by
tragedy, they're forging a bond that will help them right the wrongs committed against them and discover an
inner strength they didn't know they had. Growing bolder with each act of justice, the Sisterhood is learning
that when bad things happen, you can roll over and play dead. . .or you can get up fighting. . ..

Praise for Fern Michaels and her Sisterhood novels. . .

"Readers will enjoy seeing what happens when well-funded, very angry women take the law into their own
hands." --Booklist on Weekend Warriors

"Delectable. . .deliver[s] revenge that's creatively swift and sweet, Michaels-style." --Publishers Weekly on
Hokus Pokus

Includes bonus Sisterhood chapter!
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Fleischmann:

Book is definitely written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve Weekend Warriors (Sisterhood Book 1) will
make you to end up being smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about
anything. But some of you think this open or reading a new book make you bored. It is far from make you
fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or suitable book with you?

Diane Joiner:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Weekend Warriors
(Sisterhood Book 1) suitable to you? Typically the book was written by popular writer in this era. Often the
book untitled Weekend Warriors (Sisterhood Book 1)is the one of several books that everyone read now.
That book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new age that
you ever know prior to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to
know the core of this guide. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. So
that you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Anne Shibata:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Weekend Warriors (Sisterhood Book 1) guide
written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone
who also read the book. Written inside good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and composing
skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still doubt Weekend Warriors (Sisterhood Book
1) as good book not merely by the cover but also from the content. This is one e-book that can break don't
assess book by its cover, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your
examining sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Michael Mantz:

This Weekend Warriors (Sisterhood Book 1) is great book for you because the content which can be full of
information for you who always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This particular
book reveal it information accurately using great organize word or we can point out no rambling sentences
inside. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you
straight forward sentences but tough core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Weekend
Warriors (Sisterhood Book 1) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous a
single. We can say that no book that offer you world within ten or fifteen tiny right but this guide already do
that. So , this can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt in which?
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