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* Employs proven conception of teaching topics in commutative algebra through a focus on their
applications to algebraic geometry, a significant departure from other works on plane algebraic curves in
which the topological-analytic aspects are stressed

*Requires only a basic knowledge of algebra, with all necessary algebraic facts collected into several
appendices

* Studies algebraic curves over an algebraically closed field K and those of prime characteristic, which can
be applied to coding theory and cryptography

* Covers filtered algebras, the associated graded rings and Rees rings to deduce basic facts about intersection
theory of plane curves, applications of which are standard tools of computer algebra

* Examples, exercises, figures and suggestions for further study round out this fairly self-contained textbook
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From reader reviews:

Fabian Luton:

This Introduction to Plane Algebraic Curves book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world
is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book will be information inside this book incredible
fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This
specific Introduction to Plane Algebraic Curves without we recognize teach the one who reading it become
critical in considering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Introduction to Plane Algebraic Curves can
bring any time you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have
it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This Introduction to Plane Algebraic Curves having very good
arrangement in word and layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Teresa Hanson:

Introduction to Plane Algebraic Curves can be one of your basic books that are good idea. Many of us
recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in
words, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article writer giving
his/her effort to put every word into joy arrangement in writing Introduction to Plane Algebraic Curves but
doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource facts that
maybe you can be one among it. This great information can drawn you into new stage of crucial
contemplating.

Dolores Albert:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but novel and Introduction to Plane Algebraic Curves or others sources
were given know-how for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel would like to read more and
more. Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those guides are helping them to
put their knowledge. In some other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Introduction to Plane
Algebraic Curves to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this one.

Ida Acord:

A lot of publication has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You
can choose the most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever through searching from it.
It is named of book Introduction to Plane Algebraic Curves. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without
making the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most
essential that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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