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In the Nevada desert, an experiment has gone horribly wrong. A cloud of nanoparticles — micro-robots
— has escaped from the laboratory. This cloud is self-sustaining and self-reproducing. It is intelligent and
learns from experience. For all practical purposes, it is alive. Every attempt to destroy it has failed, and we
are the prey. Michael Crichton's most compelling novel yet tells the story of a mechanical plague and the
desperate efforts of a handful of scientists to stop it.
Drawing on up-to-the-minute scientific fact, Prey takes us into the emerging realms of nanotechnology and
artificial distributed intelligence — in a story of breathtaking suspense. Prey is a novel you can't put down.
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From reader reviews:

Lucia Morrone:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Presa (Prey), it is possible to enjoy both. It is good
combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout
men. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Whitney Obrien:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you are related is just
spending your time almost no but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. On the list of books in the top
listing in your reading list is definitely Presa (Prey). This book which is qualified as The Hungry Mountains
can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking up and review this guide you can get
many advantages.

Mark Giordano:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we would like. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This guide Presa (Prey) was filled concerning science. Spend your spare time to add your
knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading any book. If
you know how big advantage of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like
currently, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Vincent Mickens:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen have to have book to know the up-date information of year for you to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By
book Presa (Prey) we can acquire more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To be creative person
must love to read a book. Simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't always be doubt
to change your life at this book Presa (Prey). You can more appealing than now.
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